
Eileen Teichert, City Attorney Shirley Concolino, City Clerk Russell Fehr, City Treasurer
Gus Vina, Interim City Manager

City of Sacramento
City Council

915 I Street, Sacramento, CA, 95814
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Meeting Date: 3/8/2011 Report Type: Consent

Title: Contract: Award a Contract to Greater Sacramento Softball Association and Sacramento 
Metropolitan Officials Association for Umpires and Referees

Report ID: 2011-00075

Location: Citywide

Recommendation: Adopt a Resolution: 1) awarding a three-year contract with up to two, one-year 
options to renew with the Greater Sacramento Softball Association (GSSA) to provide softball 
umpires for a cumulative amount not to exceed $511,326; 2) awarding a three-year contract with up 
to two, one-year options to renew with the Sacramento Metropolitan Officials Association (SMOA) to 
provide basketball referees, volleyball referees, and baseball umpires for a cumulative amount not to 
exceed $373,850; 3) authorizing the City Manager or the City Manager’s designee to execute the 
contracts specified in Sections 1 and 2, and the required purchase orders without the need for further 
approval from City Council provided that sufficient funds are available in the budget adopted for the 
applicable fiscal year(s); and, 4) authorizing the City Manager or the City Manager’s designee to 
execute the renewal options specified in Sections 1 and 2, and the required purchase orders without 
the need for further approval from City Council provided that sufficient funds are available in the 
budget adopted for the applicable fiscal year(s).

Contact: Dave Mitchell, Operations Manager, (916)808-6076; Alan Tomiyama, Recreation Manager, 
(916) 808-8958; Greg Narramore, Recreation Superintendent, (916) 808-6095, Department of Parks 
and Recreation

Presenter: None

Department: Parks & Recreation Department

Division: Community Recreation Services

Dept ID: 19001411

Attachments:
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________

1-Description/Analysis
2-Attachment 1-Bid Evaluation
3-Background
4-Resolution
5-Exhibit A-GSSA Contract
6-Exhibit B-SMOA Contract
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Description/Analysis 

Issue: The Department of Parks and Recreation has an ongoing requirement to provide sports 

officiating for a variety of City sports leagues and programs. The current contracts with GSSA and 

SMOA expire in May 2011. The funds associated with the current contracts will have been

exhausted as of February 2011.  

Policy Considerations: The recommendations in this report are in accordance with the 

provisions of City Code Chapter 3.56 related to the purchase of supplies or services. 

In accordance with Sacramento City Council Resolution No. 2010-346, GSSA is headquartered in 

Citrus Heights and SMOA is headquartered in Sacramento, California. The proposed contract 

awards are consistent with Resolution No. 2010-346 prohibiting the City from entering into any 

contract to purchase goods or services from any business or entity headquartered in Arizona. 

Environmental Considerations:  

California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA):  This report concerns the purchase of sport 

umpires and sport referees for the Department of Parks and Recreation. Continuing 

administrative activities, such as the purchases of sport umpires and referees, is not a “project” 

for the purposes of CEQA pursuant to section 15378(b)(2) of the CEQA guidelines (Title 14 

Cal. Code Reg. § 15000 et seq.) and is exempt from CEQA pursuant to section 15061(b)(3) of 

the CEQA Guidelines.

Sustainability Considerations: The contractors agree to supply the City of Sacramento with 

environmentally preferable and effective products in compliance with the specifications stated 

in the solicitation/contract and provide services that help minimize the environmental impact 

resulting from use and disposal of products specified in the bid/contract. The contractors

further agree that their products specified in the bid do not contain any items, ingredients or 

components prohibited under the City’s Sustainable Procurement Policy.

Commission/Committee Action: There was not any Park and Recreation Commission action on 

this item, as this is an administrative matter.

Rationale for Recommendation: The Department of Parks and Recreation has an ongoing 

requirement to provide sports officiating for a variety of City sports leagues and programs. 

On November 8, 2010, the Department of Parks and Recreation, in accordance with City Code 

Chapter 3.56 issued Invitation for Bid No. B111531004 for the services of sports officials.  Four 

responses were received. GSSA and SMOA presented the most responsive and responsible bids 

for the sports services presented. A summary of the bid results is provided in Attachment 1.   

Financial Considerations:  There are sufficient funds available in the Department of Parks and 

Recreation’s operating budget for the purchase of services of sports officials through June 30, 

2011. Purchases after June 30, 2011 and subsequent years’ funding for the contract is subject to 

sufficient funds allocated for this purpose in the annual budget appropriation for the applicable 

fiscal years. 
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The table below shows the estimated annual amounts used to determine the total contract amount 

for GSSA and SMOA.

Vendor Year 1 

Estimate

Year 2

Estimate

Year 3 

Estimate

Year 4 

Estimate

Year 5 

Estimate

Total 

Contract

GSSA $79,704 $93,637 $102,931 $112,521 $122,533 $511,326

SMOA $53,827 $63,658 $74,063 $85,200 $97,102 $373,850

The total for both contracts is $885,176.

Emerging Small Business Development (ESBD): GSSA and SMOA are not certified with the 

City as an emerging/small business enterprise.
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IFB Eval Form (Excel)

11/24/2010

Parks & Recreation

B111531004

190001531

Bernadette Cheek

916-808-6097

QTY
UNIT PRICE 

per game

TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT PRICE 

per game

TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT PRICE 

per game

TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT PRICE 

per game

TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT PRICE TOTAL 

PRICE

550 No Bid 55.00$            30,250.00$     100.00$          55,000.00$     63.00$            34,650.00$     -$                -$                

600 No Bid 57.20              34,320.00       102.37            61,422.00       66.32              39,792.00       -                  -                  

650 No Bid 59.48              38,662.00       104.64            68,016.00       69.82              45,383.00       -                  -                  

700 No Bid 61.86              43,302.00       107.01            74,907.00       73.50              51,450.00       -                  

750 No Bid 64.33              48,247.50       109.38            82,035.00       77.36              58,020.00       -                  

No Bid 10% 3,025.00         20.00              11,000.00       -                  -                  -                  

No Bid 10% 3,432.00         22.37              13,422.00       -                  -                  

No Bid 10% 3,866.20         27.74              18,031.00       -                  -                  

No Bid 10% 4,330.20         27.11              19,877.00       -                  -                  

No Bid 10% 4,824.75         29.48              22,110.00       -                  -                  

Line 1

Quote Number 1 Quote Number 2 Quote Number 3

Contact:

Phone: 916-833-5471

Contact Person

South East Asian Language

Phone: 916-622-9060

Pao MoriaBruce RobbinsJeff DubchanskyBasketball

Vendor #2 Vendor #3Requisition Information Vendor #1

GSSA SMOA

Administrative Fee - year 5

214,259.65$                              -$                                           

BID EVALUATION SECTION

425,820.00$                              229,295.00$                              

Basketball Referee- year 4

Basketball Referee- year 5

Administrative Fee -first year

Administrative Fee - year 2

Bid total

Sacto Area Sports Officials

Quote Number: 4

Contact Person Contact Person

Vendor #5

Quote Number

Phone: 916-452-2050

Contact Person

Vendor #4

Award:  SMOA for 

basketball referee's.

Notes/Comments

Phone: 916-835-3825

Item Description

Phone

Russell Tahinaha

Org. No.:

Attachment 1

Date:

Basketball Referee- year 2

Basketball Referee- year 3

Org. Name:

Contact Person

-$                                           

Req. No.:

Administrative Fee - year 4

Administrative Fee -year 3

Phone:

Basketball Referee- first year

PRICING SECTION
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11/24/2010

Parks & Recreation

B111531004

190001531

Bernadette Cheek

916-808-6097

QTY
UNIT PRICE 

per game

TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT PRICE 

per game

TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT PRICE 

per game

TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT PRICE 

per game

TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT PRICE TOTAL 

PRICE

100 No Bid 61.60$           6,160.00$      No Bid No Bid -$               -$               

100 No Bid 61.60$           6,160.00$      No Bid No Bid -                 -                 

70 No Bid 12.32             862.40           No Bid No Bid -                 -                 

120 No Bid 64.60$           7,752.00$      No Bid No Bid -$               -$               

120 No Bid 64.60$           7,752.00$      No Bid No Bid -                 -                 

70 No Bid 12.81             896.70           No Bid No Bid -                 -                 

140 No Bid 67.18             9,405.20        No Bid No Bid -                 

140 No Bid 67.18             9,405.20        No Bid No Bid -$               -$               

70 No Bid 13.32             932.40           No Bid No Bid -                 -                 

160 No Bid 69.87             11,179.20      No Bid No Bid -                 -                 

160 No Bid 69.87             11,179.20      No Bid No Bid -                 

70 No Bid 13.85             969.50           No Bid No Bid -                 

180 No Bid 72.66             13,078.80      No Bid No Bid -                 

180 No Bid 72.66             13,078.80      No Bid No Bid -                 

70 No Bid 14.40             1,008.00        No Bid No Bid -                 

No Bid 10% 1,318.24        No Bid No Bid -                 

No Bid 10% 1,640.07        No Bid No Bid -                 

No Bid 10% 1,974.28$      No Bid No Bid -$               -$               

No Bid 10% 2,332.79        No Bid No Bid -                 -                 

No Bid 10% 2,716.56        No Bid No Bid -                 -                 

-                 -                 

Line 1

Umpire #1 yr 5

Umpire #2 yr 5

Renfree Extra Duties yr 5

Administrative Fee - year 2

-$                                        

Administrative Fee -first year

PRICING SECTION

Item Description

Umpire #1 yr 1

Umpire #2 yr 1

Renfree Extra Duties yr 1

Renfree Extra Duties yr 4

Umpire #1 yr 2

Umpire #2 yr 2

Renfree Extra Duties yr 2

Umpire #1 yr 3

Baseball

Umpire #2 yr 3

Renfree Extra Duties yr 3

Umpire #1 yr 4

Umpire #2 yr 4

Jeff Dubchansky Bruce Robbins Pao Moria Russell Tahinaha

Phone: Contact Person Contact Person Contact Person Contact Person Contact Person

Contact:

Org. No.: Phone: 916-622-9060 Phone: 916-835-3825 Phone: 916-833-5471 Phone: 916-452-2050 Phone

Req. No.:

SMOA South East Asian Language Sacto Area Sports Officials

Org. Name: Quote Number 1 Quote Number 2 Quote Number 3 Quote Number: 4 Quote Number

-$                                        

Requisition Information Vendor #1 Vendor #2 Vendor #3 Vendor #4 Vendor #5
Date: GSSA

Administrative Fee -year 3

Bid Total

BID EVALUATION SECTION

-$                                        109,801.34$                            -$                                        

Administrative Fee - year 4

Administrative Fee - year 5
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Notes/Comments

Award SMOA for 
baseball umpire's.
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11/24/2010

Parks & Recreation

B111531004

190001531

Bernadette Cheek

916-808-6097

QTY
UNIT PRICE 

per game

TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT PRICE 

per game

TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT PRICE 

per game

TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT PRICE 

per game

TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT PRICE TOTAL 

PRICE

2,600 23.00             59,800.00$    No Bid No Bid No Bid -$               -$               

3,000 23.46             70,380.00      No Bid No Bid No Bid -                 -                 

3,200 23.93             76,576.00      No Bid No Bid No Bid -                 -                 

3,400 24.40             82,960.00      No Bid No Bid No Bid -                 

3,600 24.90             89,640.00      No Bid No Bid No Bid -                 

8% 4,784.00        No Bid No Bid No Bid -                 

8% 5,630.40        No Bid No Bid No Bid -                 

8% 6,126.08        No Bid No Bid No Bid -                 

8% 6,636.80        No Bid No Bid No Bid -                 

8% 7,171.20        No Bid No Bid No Bid -                 

Line 1

Softball - year 5

Administrative Fee -first year

Administrative Fee - year 2

Administrative Fee - year 4

Administrative Fee - year 5

Bid Total

Administrative Fee -year 3

BID EVALUATION SECTION

409,704.48$                             -$                                         

PRICING SECTION

Item Description

Softball- first year

Softball - year 2

Softball - year 3

Softball - year 4

Softball-1 umpire Jeff Dubchansky Bruce Robbins Pao Moria Russell Tahinaha

Phone: Contact Person Contact Person Contact Person Contact Person Contact Person

Contact:

Org. No.: Phone: 916-622-9060 Phone: 916-835-3825 Phone: 916-833-5471 Phone: 916-452-2050 Phone

Req. No.:

Org. Name: Quote Number 1 Quote Number 2 Quote Number 3 Quote Number: 4 Quote Number

Date: GSSA SMOA South East Asian Language Sacto Area Sports Officials

-$                                         -$                                         -$                                         

Requisition Information Vendor #1 Vendor #2 Vendor #3 Vendor #4 Vendor #5

Award GSSA  softball -1 
umpire 

Notes/Comments
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11/24/2010

Parks & Recreation

B111531004

190001531

Bernadette Cheek

916-808-6097

QTY
UNIT PRICE 

per game

TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT PRICE 

per game

TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT PRICE 

per game

TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT PRICE 

per game

TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT PRICE TOTAL 

PRICE

350 40.00             14,000.00$    No Bid No Bid No Bid -$               -$               

400 40.80             16,320.00      No Bid No Bid No Bid -                 -                 

450 41.62             18,729.00      No Bid No Bid No Bid -                 -                 

500 42.45             21,225.00      No Bid No Bid No Bid -                 

550 43.30             23,815.00      No Bid No Bid No Bid -                 

8% 1,120.00        No Bid No Bid No Bid -                 

8% 1,305.60        No Bid No Bid No Bid -                 

8% 1,498.32        No Bid No Bid No Bid -                 

8% 1,698.00        No Bid No Bid No Bid -                 

8% 1,905.20        No Bid No Bid No Bid -                 

Line 1

Softball Umpire- year 5

Administrative Fee -first year

Administrative Fee - year 2

Administrative Fee - year 4

Administrative Fee - year 5

Bid Total

Administrative Fee -year 3

BID EVALUATION SECTION

101,616.12$                            -$                                        

PRICING SECTION

Item Description

Softball umpire- first year

Softball Umpire- year 2

Softball Umpire- year 3

Softball Umpire- year 4

Softball-2 Umpires Jeff Dubchansky Bruce Robbins Pao Moria Russell Tahinaha

Phone: Contact Person Contact Person Contact Person Contact Person Contact Person

Contact:

Org. No.: Phone: 916-622-9060 Phone: 916-835-3825 Phone: 916-833-5471 Phone: 916-452-2050 Phone

Req. No.:

Org. Name: Quote Number 1 Quote Number 2 Quote Number 3 Quote Number: 4 Quote Number

Date: GSSA SMOA South East Asian Language Sacto Area Sports Officials

-$                                        -$                                        -$                                        

Requisition Information Vendor #1 Vendor #2 Vendor #3 Vendor #4 Vendor #5

Notes/Comments

Award GSSA- Softball-2 
Umpire's
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11/24/2010

Parks & Recreation

B111531004

190001531

Bernadette Cheek

916-808-6097

QTY
UNIT PRICE 

per game

TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT PRICE 

per game

TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT PRICE 

per game

TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT PRICE 

per game

TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT PRICE TOTAL 

PRICE

200 No Bid 27.50$           5,500.00$      No Bid 31.50$           6,300.00$      -$               -$               

250 No Bid 28.60             7,150.00        No Bid 33.16             8,290.00        -                 -                 

300 No Bid 29.74             8,922.00        No Bid 34.91             10,473.00      -                 -                 

350 No Bid 30.92             10,822.00      No Bid 36.75             12,862.50      -                 

400 No Bid 32.15             12,860.00      No Bid 38.68             15,472.00      -                 

No Bid 10% 550.00           No Bid -                 -                 

No Bid 10% 715.00           No Bid -                 -                 

No Bid 10% 892.20           No Bid -                 -                 

No Bid 10% 1,082.20        No Bid -                 -                 

No Bid 10% 1,286.00        No Bid -                 -                 

Line 1

Date:

Requisition Information

Volleyball

Phone:

Contact:

Org. No.:

Req. No.:

Org. Name:

PRICING SECTION

Item Description

Volleyball Referee- first year

Volleyball Referee- year 2

Volleyball Referee- year 3

Volleyball Referee- year 4

BID EVALUATION SECTION

Volleyball Referee- year 5

Administrative Fee -first year

Administrative Fee - year 2

Administrative Fee -year 3

Administrative Fee - year 4

Administrative Fee - year 5

Notes/Comments

-$                                        53,397.50$                              -$                                        49,779.40$                              -$                                        Bid total

Award SMOA Volleyball 
referee's

Russell TahinahaPao MoriaBruce RobbinsJeff Dubchansky

Contact PersonContact PersonContact PersonContact PersonContact Person

PhonePhone: 916-452-2050Phone: 916-833-5471Phone: 916-835-3825Phone: 916-622-9060

Quote NumberQuote Number: 4Quote Number 3Quote Number 2Quote Number 1

Sacto Area Sports OfficialsSouth East Asian LanguageSMOAGSSA

Vendor #5Vendor #4Vendor #3Vendor #2Vendor #1
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Background

The Department of Parks and Recreation Adult Sports Program consists of softball, 

baseball, basketball, and volleyball. Adult Sports provides competitive and non-

competitive sport activities for men, women and co-ed groups from the novice to the 

most advanced player. In 2010, the Department of Parks and Recreation provided 

4,112 softball games, 232 baseball games, 600 basketball games and 32 volleyball 

games throughout the City and County of Sacramento. Sacramento ranks number three 

in the nation in per capita adult softball participation.

The Adult Sports Program provides a wide variety of fun, safe, challenging and 

engaging sport activities to approximately 8,000 adults.  These activities foster positive 

interactions and healthy lifestyles in the Sacramento community.  Participating in 

organized sports allow participants to meet new people from a variety of cultures, builds 

relationships and friendships with team members, and enhances skill development and 

the many health benefits associated with sports activities. 
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RESOLUTION NO. 2011-

Adopted by the Sacramento City Council

MARCH 8, 2011

AWARD A CONTRACT TO GREATER SACRAMENTO SOFTBALL ASSOCIATION 
AND SACRAMENTO METROPOLITAN OFFICIALS ASSOCIATION FOR UMPIRES 

AND REFEREES

BACKGROUND

A. The Department of Parks and Recreation has an ongoing requirement for umpires
and referees for a variety of City sports leagues and programs.

B. On November 8, 2010, the Department of Parks and Recreation, in accordance 
with City Code Chapter 3.56 issued Invitation for Bid No. B111531004 for the 
purchase of sports officials. Four responses were received. Greater Sacramento 
Softball Association (“GSSA”) and Sacramento Metropolitan Officials Association 
(“SMOA”) were the lowest responsive and responsible bidders.

C. Each proposed contract has a three year term with the City having the option to 
renew each contract for up to two one-year terms. 

D. The estimated cost of providing sports officials from GSSA for the current fiscal 
year is $79,704 and the total cost of the services over the three-year contract and 
two one-year options is $511,326.The estimated cost of providing sports officials
from SMOA for the current fiscal year is $53,824 and the total cost of the services 
over the three-year contract and two one-year options is $373,850. Subsequent 
years’ funding for the contracts is subject to sufficient funds allocated for this 
purpose in the annual budget appropriation for the applicable fiscal years. The 
total estimated cost for the above services is $885,176.

BASED ON THE FACTS SET FORTH IN THE BACKGROUND, THE CITY COUNCIL 
RESOLVES AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Greater Sacramento Softball Association is awarded a three-year contract 
with up to two, one-year options to renew to provide softball umpires for a 
cumulative amount not to exceed $511,326.

Section 2.   Sacramento Metropolitan Officials Association is awarded a three-year 
contract with up to two, one-year options to renew to provide basketball 
referees, volleyball referees, and baseball umpires for a cumulative amount 
not to exceed $373,850.

Section 3.    The City Manager or the City Manager’s designee is authorized to execute 
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the contracts specified in Sections 1 and 2 and the required purchase 
orders without the need for further approval from City Council provided that 
sufficient funds are available in the budget adopted for the applicable fiscal 
year(s).

Section 4.    City Manager or the City Manager’s designee is authorized to exercise and 
execute the renewal options specified in Sections 1 and 2 and the required 
purchase orders without the need for further approval from City Council
provided that sufficient funds are available in the budget adopted for the 
applicable fiscal year(s).

Section 5.     The contracts described in Sections 1 and 2 are attached as Exhibit A and 
Exhibit B and made part of this Resolution.
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