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Meeting Date: 8/23/2011 Report Type: Consent

Title: Lower American River Salmonid Contradts:  Spawning Gravel Augmentation Project 
(G14000200)

Report ID: 2011-00714

Location: Citywide

Recommendation: Adopt a Resolution authorizing the City Manager or his designee to execute the 
necessary contracts and purchase orders for equipment rental with: 1) Holt of California dba The CAT 
Rental Store in the amount of $94,885, plus $7,000 for unanticipated damages and wear and tear to 
equipment and 2) with Hertz Equipment Rental Corporation in the amount of $5,152, plus $500 to 
cover unanticipated damages and wear and tear to equipment, for work associated with the Lower 
American River Salmonid Spawning Gravel Augmentation Project being administered by the City-
County Office of Metropolitan Water Planning.

Contact: Sarah Foley, Program Manager, (916) 808-1997, Department of Utilities

Presenter: NOne

Department: Department Of Utilities

Division: C/Co Ofc Water Planning

Dept ID: 14001911
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Eileen Teichert, City Attorney Shirley Concolino, City Clerk Russell Fehr, City Treasurer
William H. Edgar, Interim City Manager

Attachments:
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________

1-Description/Analysis
2-Background
3-Resolution
4-UnExecuted Contract Covert Holts
5-Contract for Holt
6-UnExecuted Contract Cover Hertz
7-Contract Hertz

_________________________________________________________________________
City Attorney Review

Approved as to Form
Joe Robinson
8/11/2011 2:49:14 PM

City Treasurer Review
Prior Council Financial Policy Approval or 
Outside City Treasurer Scope
Russell Fehr
8/9/2011 1:29:54 PM

Approvals/Acknowledgements

Department Director or Designee: Marty Hanneman - 8/11/2011 8:50:59 AM

Assistant City Manager: John Dangberg - 8/11/2011 11:49:03 AM
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Description/Analysis 

Issue: The CCOMWP has partnered with the U.S. Bureau of Reclamation, U.S. 

Fish and Wildlife (FWS), California Department of Fish and Game and 

Sacramento County Regional Parks on the Lower American River Salmonid 

Spawning Gravel Augmentation Project (G14000200) (Project).  The purpose of 

the Project is to increase the availability of spawning gravel and rearing habitat 

for fall-run Chinook salmon and steelhead trout in the lower American River.  

This report recommends approval of contracts for equipment rental necessary to 

perform the Project.  Pursuant to the Interagency Agreement that created the 

CCOMWP, the City’s procedures are followed for all CCOMWP contracting 

activities.

Policy Considerations: This Project will aid fish habitat restoration efforts for the Lower 

American River, consistent with goals of the Water Forum Agreement.  One

recommended contract is with the low bidder; and the other contract is with the 

only bidder for rental of the specific equipment necessary to perform the Project.

Environmental Considerations:  

California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) and National Environmental 

Policy Act (NEPA):  

The Project is subject to review pursuant to both CEQA and NEPA. The Bureau 

of Reclamation is responsible for NEPA review. The Bureau prepared a Finding 

of No Significant Impact (FONSI) for the Project. The NEPA review process does 

not require action by the City. 

The Project is exempt from CEQA review pursuant to CEQA Guidelines Section 

15333, Small Restoration Projects. The project does not exceed five acres in 

size, will be undertaken for the purpose of restoring habitat for fish, would have 

no significant impact on endangered, rare or threatened species or their habitat, 

and would not otherwise result in any significant effects on the environment. 

Sustainability Considerations: Implementation of the Project is consistent with 

the City of Sacramento’s Sustainability Master Plan Goals:  

Sustainability Goal No. 7 - Parks, Open Space and Habitat Conservation is 

promoted by the second co-equal objective of the Water Forum Agreement “To 

preserve the fishery, wildlife, recreational, and aesthetic values of the lower 

American River.”

Commission/Committee Action: None
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Rationale for Recommendation: Approval of equipment rental contracts with the 

low bidders will provide equipment needed to implement the Project.  Replenishing 

gravel in the lower American River will improve spawning and rearing habitat for 

anadromous fish.  

Financial Considerations:  This Project has no impact on the City of Sacramento’s

General Fund.  On August 16, 2011 the Sacramento City Council authorized the 

execution of Funding Agreement C2010-0694-1 with the United States Fish and 

Wildlife Service for an additional $253,773 in federal funding for the Project, bringing 

the total funding for the Project to date to $1,683,468.00.  There are sufficient 

Habitat Management Element funds (Fund 7104) in the project (G14000200) for 

rental of this equipment in an amount not to exceed (1) $107,537 for the equipment 

rental contract with Holt of California (includes $7,000 funding contingency to cover 

unanticipated damages and wear and tear to equipment), and (2) $5,652 for the 

equipment rental contract with Hertz Equipment Rental Corporation (includes $500 

funding contingency to cover unanticipated damages and wear and tear to 

equipment).  

Emerging Small Business Development (ESBD):  Neither firm is certified by the City 

of Sacramento as an Emerging Business.
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Background Information:

The United States Bureau of Reclamation (Reclamation) operates facilities that regulate 

flows in the lower American River, which contains populations of anadromous Chinook 

salmon and threatened steelhead trout.  Flow regulation and stream channel 

manipulations have modified anadromous salmonid habitat in the American River.  

Specifically, gravel is regularly lost from spawning sites on the river because of the 

construction and operation of Central Valley Project dams, bank protection projects, and 

other actions that reduce the availability of spawning gravel and rearing habitat in the 

American River downstream of Nimbus Dam.

In 2006 Reclamation approached the CCOMWP, on behalf of the Sacramento Region 

Water Forum, to assist Reclamation and other project partners in carrying out the

Project.  Assistance from the CCOMWP includes project planning, permitting, inter-

agency coordination, and contracting.  Pursuant to the Interagency Agreement that 

created the CCOMWP, the City’s procedures are followed for all CCOMWP contracting 

activities.  This is the fifth year of this project.

Reclamation has chosen to utilize mining dredgings at Sailor Bar in the American River 

Parkway for this Project. These dredgings were identified as having significant historical 

value during Reclamation’s environmental analysis for the Project because of the type 

of mining activity that produced the dredgings. Project partners have developed an 

interpretive exhibit about historic mining activities in the Parkway that will mitigate for 

the use of these dredgings. This mitigation is the subject of a Memorandum of 

Agreement (MOA) between Reclamation, County Parks and SHPO. The CCOMWP, on 

behalf of the Water Forum, has signed this MOA as a concurring party.

This Project is consistent with the goals of the Fisheries and Instream Habitat Plan, 

which is incorporated into the River Corridor Management Plan (RCMP). The RCMP is 

a coordinated approach to management of the lower American River that was 

developed and endorsed by 38 organizations and local governments in 2002, including 

the City of Sacramento. The RCMP serves as the implementation vehicle for the Habitat 

Management Element (HME) of the Water Forum Agreement, of which the City of 

Sacramento is a signatory. The HME implements one of the Agreement’s co-equal 

objectives, which is to preserve the fishery, wildlife, recreational and aesthetic values of 

the lower American River.

The Request for Bids was advertised on the City of Sacramento online Bid Center 

beginning on July 1, 2011.   
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In addition to advertising this opportunity on the City of Sacramento online Bid Center, 

telephone calls were made to the following vendors notifying them of the bid 

opportunity:

 Hertz Equipment Rental
 I-5 Rentals
 Ford Construction
 Holt of California
 Volvo Rents 

Two bids were received and opened on July 14, 2011, from Holt of California (dba The 
CAT Rental Store) and Hertz Equipment Rental.  The bid results are summarized in the 
table below.
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Bid Results – Bid No. B12-14001911-01

* Pressure washing of in-river equipment included in bid to avoid the spread of invasive species.

Item Quantity

Hertz Equipment

Rental 

Corporation

Holt of California

Dba The CAT Rental 

Store

A.  CAT D8T or D9 dozer with 

biodegradable fluids for in-river work 

(Hi Tracked).*
1 No Bid $22,978.13

B.  CAT 966 front end loader with a 

5 cubic yard capacity toothed bucket 1 No Bid $10,129.75

C.  CAT 938 front end loader with a 

2.5 to 3.0 cubic yard toothed bucket 1 No Bid $5,048.75

D.  CAT 325 or 330 tracked 

excavator with grousers and a 60-

inch to 72-inch wide toothed bucket 1 No Bid $10,337.50

E.  2,000 gallon capacity, or larger, 

water truck with sprayers for dust 

control 1 $1,708.92 $2,355.00

F.  10-wheel end dump truck with 10 

to 12 yard capacity rock bed 1 $3,442.61 $4,725.50

G.  25-ton off road end dump trucks 2 No Bid $28,555.00

H.  CAT 950 or JD 644J front end 

loaders with a 5 cubic yard capacity 

toothed bucket with biodegradable 

fluids for in-river work.* 2 No Bid $14,752.06

I.  Portable toilet with weekly 

servicings 1 No Bid $96.98

J.  CAT 314 or 315 tracked 

excavator with an 18 to 24 inch 

bucket with a thumb and 

biodegradable fluids for in-river 

work.* 1 No Bid $2,986.33

Total $5,151.53 $101,965.00
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RESOLUTION NO.

Adopted by the Sacramento City Council

AWARDING EQUIPMENT RENTAL CONTRACTS FOR LOWER AMERICAN 

RIVER SALMONID SPAWNING GRAVEL AUGMENTATION PROJECT

BACKGROUND

A. The United States Bureau of Reclamation (Reclamation) operates facilities that 
regulate flows in the lower American River, which contains populations of 
anadromous Chinook salmon and threatened steelhead trout.  Gravel is regularly 
lost from spawning sites on the river as a result of the construction and operation 
of Central Valley Project dams, bank protection projects, and other actions that 
reduce the availability of spawning gravel and rearing habitat in the American 
River downstream of Nimbus Dam.

B. In October 2006 the City of Sacramento entered into a five-year grant funding 
agreement with Reclamation, on behalf of the City County Office of Metropolitan 
Water Planning (CCOMWP), for the Lower American River Salmonid Spawning 
Gravel Augmentation Project (“Project”) being administered by the CCOMWP. 
Reclamation has provided $1,181,000 for this Project to date. The purpose of the 
Project is to increase the availability of spawning gravel and rearing habitat for 
fall-run Chinook salmon and steelhead trout in the lower American River.

C. Additional funding for the Project has been provided by the United States Fish 
and Wildlife Service and the County of Sacramento Department of 
Transportation, bringing the total Project funding to date to $1,683,468.00.

D. CCOMWP staff advertised a Request for Bids for equipment rental necessary to 
perform the Project, and two bids were received and opened on July 14, 2011, 
from Holt of California, dba The CAT Rental Store, and from Hertz Equipment 
Rental Corporation.

BASED ON THE FACTS SET FORTH IN THE BACKGROUND, THE CITY COUNCIL 

RESOLVES AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. The City Manager or his designee is authorized to execute contracts and 

purchase orders for equipment rental, for work associated with the Lower 

American River Salmonid Spawning Gravel Augmentation Project, with

Holt of California, dba The CAT Rental Store, in an amount not to exceed 

$101,885, and with Hertz Equipment Rental Corporation, in an amount not 

to exceed $5,652. 
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Report Title

Unexecuted Contract/Agreements 

 The Unexecuted Contract/Agreement is signed by the other party, is attached as 
an exhibit to the resolution, and is approved as to form by the City Attorney.

 The Unexecuted Contract/Agreement (Public Project) is NOT signed by the other 
party, is attached as an exhibit to the resolution, and is approved as to form by 
the City Attorney.

 The Unexecuted Contract is NOT included as an exhibit to the Resolution 
because the Agreement(s) is with other another governmental agency and it is 
not feasible to obtain the other agency’s signature prior to Council action (be they 
denominated Agreements, MOUs, MOAs, etc.); however, the City Attorney 
approves the forwarding of the report to Council even though the signed 
agreement is not in hand yet.

 The Unexecuted Contract is NOT included as an exhibit to the resolution 
because, due to special circumstances, and the City Attorney confirms in writing 
that it is okay to proceed with Council action even though the signed agreement
is not in hand yet.

All unexecuted contracts/agreements which are signed by the other parties are in the 
Office of the City Clerk before agenda publication.
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