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Meeting Date: 10/30/2012 Report Type: Consent

Title: Contract: Citywide Towing and Roadside Services

Report ID: 2012-00841

Location: Citywide

Recommendation: Pass a Motion: 1) awarding one-year contracts with three one-year renewal 
options for the purchase of towing and roadside services to:  a) Arnold’s Towing, Inc. in an amount 
not to exceed $1,095,683 for the potential four-year period; b) College Oak Towing in an amount not 
to exceed $474,775 for the potential four-year period; and 3) Pirtek Power Inn in an amount not to 
exceed $1,070,340 for the potential four-year period; and  2) authorizing the City Manager or the City 
Manager’s designee to execute the contracts and renewal options specified above provided that 
sufficient funds are available in the budget adopted for the applicable fiscal year.

Contact: Keith Leech, Fleet Manager, (916) 808-5869, General Services Department

Presenter: None

Department: General Services Dept

Division: Fleet Management Admin

Dept ID: 13001311

Attachments:
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________

1-Description/Analysis
2-Attachment 1-Bid Results
3-Attachment 2-Estimated Annual Expenditures
4-Contract Arnold Towing
5-Contract College Oak Towing
6-Contract Pirtek Power Inn

_________________________________________________________________________
City Attorney Review

Approved as to Form
Kourtney Burdick
10/22/2012 9:59:41 AM

City Treasurer Review
Reviewed for Impact on Cash and Debt
Russell Fehr
10/11/2012 4:25:08 PM

Approvals/Acknowledgements

Department Director or Designee: Craig Lymus - 10/17/2012 7:48:36 AM

1 of 130

6

http://www.cityofsacramento.org/


Description/Analysis 

Issue: The Department of General Services, Fleet Management Division, has an ongoing 
need to provide towing and roadside services in support of various City departments. 

Policy Considerations: The recommendations in this report are in accordance with the 
provisions of City Code Chapter 3.56 and Resolution No. 2010-346 prohibiting the City from 
entering into any contract to purchase goods or services from any business or entity 
headquartered in Arizona.

Economic Impacts: None

Environmental Considerations:

California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA): The recommendations in this report 
involve the purchase of towing and roadside services and are exempt from CEQA review 
pursuant to CEQA Guidelines Section 15061(b)(3) because it can be seen with certainty 
that there is no possibility that the activity may have a significant effect on the 
environment.  

Sustainability: Not applicable

Commission/Committee Action: None

Rationale for Recommendation: The Department of General Services, Fleet Management 
Division, has an ongoing need to provide towing and roadside services in support of various 
City departments. 

On April 2, 2012, the Department of General Services, Fleet Management Division, in 
accordance with City Code Chapter 3.56, issued Invitation for Bid No. B12131311005 for 
towing and roadside services.  The bid included categories for light-duty towing, heavy-duty 
towing, and roadside services, which includes services such as on scene fabrication and 
replacement of hydraulic hoses, and a 45 minute response time for emergency assistance.  
Bids were received from Arnold’s Towing, Inc., College Oak Towing, and Pirtek Power Inn but 
none included bids for all three categories.  Therefore, this report recommends awarding a 
contract to each of these vendors so that all required categories of service are provided.  Each 
of these vendors is the lowest responsive and responsible bidder in their respective categories.  
A summary of the bid results is provided in Attachment 1.

Financial Considerations: The contracts for towing services include a provision allowing annual 
price increases, due primarily to the rising cost of fuel.  The recommended contract amounts 
shown in Attachment 2 include a ten percent annual increase for this provision.  Sufficient funds 
are available in the Department of General Services, Fleet Management Division, FY2012/13 
operating budget (Fleet Fund, Fund 6501) to purchase towing and roadside services through 
June 30, 2013. Purchases made after June 30, 2013 are subject to funding availability in the 
adopted budget of the applicable fiscal year.  

Emerging Small Business Development (ESBD): Arnold’s Towing, Inc., College Oak Towing 
and Pirtek Power Inn are all certified as emerging/small businesses.
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Attachment 1

Bid Results – Bid No. B12131311005

Category A

Light Duty Towing 

Arnold’s Towing, 
Inc.

College Oak 
Towing

Pirtek’s Power 
Inn 

Bid Amount $214,625.00     $340,750.00 No bid
5% ESBE Preference ($10,731.25) ($17,037.50)
Prompt Payment 
Discount (6% - 30 
days)

($12,877.50) none

Bid Evaluation Total $191,016.25 $323,712.50

Category B

Heavy Duty Towing 

Arnold’s 
Towing, Inc.

College Oak 
Towing

Pirtek’s Power 
Inn 

Bid Amount No bid $93,000.00 No bid
5% ESBE Preference ($4,650.00)
Prompt Payment 
Discount (20% - 21 
days)

($18,600.00)

Bid Evaluation Total $69,750.00

Category C

Roadside Services 

Arnold’s 
Towing, Inc.

College Oak 
Towing

Pirtek’s Power 
Inn 

Bid Amount No bid No bid $267,585.00
5% ESBE Preference ($13,379.25)
Prompt Payment 
Discount

none

Bid Evaluation Total $254,205.75
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Attachment 2

Estimated Annual Expenditures and Total Contract Amounts 

Category A

Light Duty Towing

Contract Amount: $1,095,683

Year Basis 10% Fuel Allowance Annual Expenditure
1 $214,625.00 $21,462.50 $236,087.50
2 $236,087.50 $23,608.75 $259,696.25
3 $259,696.25 $25,969.63 $285,665.88
4 $285,665.88 $28,566.59 $314,232.46

Total $1,095,682.09

Category B

Heavy Duty Towing

Contract Amount: $474,775

Year Basis 10% Fuel Allowance Annual Expenditure
1 $93,000.00 $9,300.00 $102,300.00
2 $102,300.00 $10,230.00 $112,530.00
3 $112,530.00 $11,253.00 $123,783.00
4 $123,783.00 $12,378.30 $136,161.30

Total $474,774.30

Category C

Roadside Services

Contract Amount: $1,070,340

Year Annual Expenditure
1 $267,585.00
2 $267,585.00
3 $267,585.00
4 $267,585.00

Total $1,070,340.00
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