
James Sanchez, City Attorney Shirley Concolino, City Clerk Russell Fehr, City Treasurer

John F. Shirey, City Manager

Meeting Date: 4/23/2013

Report Type: Consent

Report ID: 2013-00339

Title: Contracts: Swimming Pool Chemicals

Location: Citywide

Issue: There is an on-going need to purchase a variety of chemicals required to operate 
and maintain the City’s swimming pools, wading pools and fountains located at 20 
potential locations.

Recommendation: Pass a Motion: 1) awarding a one-year contract to Lincoln 
Equipment, Inc., for the purchase of swimming pool chemicals in an amount not to 
exceed $370,827 for Fiscal Year 2013-14; and 2) authorizing the City Manager or the 
City Manager’s designee to extend the contract for up to two additional years for an 
amount not to exceed $370,827 per year or $1,112,481 for the potential three year 
period; 3) authorizing the City Manager or the City Manager’s designee to execute the 
contracts specified above provided that sufficient funds are available in the budget 
adopted for the applicable fiscal year.

Contact: Elizabeth Anderson, Operations Manager, (916) 808-6076; Shannon Brown, 
Parks Manager, (916) 808-4070, Parks and Recreation Department

Presenter: None.

Department: Parks & Recreation Department

Division: Aquatics

Dept ID: 19001521

Attachments:

1-Description/Analysis

2-Summary of Bids

3-Lincoln Equip Inc Contract
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City Attorney Review

Approved as to Form

Sheryl Patterson

4/10/2013 2:42:21 PM

City Treasurer Review
Reviewed for Impact on Cash and Debt

Russell Fehr
4/8/2013 11:21:35 AM

Approvals/Acknowledgements

Department Director or Designee: Jim Combs - 4/9/2013 3:36:26 PM

City Council Report
915 I Street, 1st Floor

www.CityofSacramento.org

1 of 48

5

http://www.cityofsacramento.org/


Description/Analysis

Issue:  The Parks and Recreation Department has an on-going need to purchase 

chemicals required to operate and maintain the City’s swimming pools, wading pools 

and fountains located at 20 potential locations. The chemicals are powerful 

disinfectants used to maintain acceptable water quality. 

Policy Considerations:  The recommendations in this report are in accordance with the 

provisions of the City Code Chapter 3.56 related to the purchase of supplies.

Environmental Considerations:

California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA):  The current proposal involves the 

purchase of chemicals for swimming pools and fountains accessible to the public. 

Continuing maintenance activities, such as the purchase of supplies, is not a “project” 

for the purposes of CEQA pursuant to Section 15378(b)(2) of the CEQA Guidelines (Title 

14 Cal. Code Reg. § 15000 et seq.). Therefore, no environmental review is necessary.

Sustainability Considerations: The chemicals to be purchased are a requirement of 

the State of California Health and Safety Code for water quality and human contact. All 

storage and usage of these chemicals is in compliance with county, state and federal 

regulations. The chemicals are stored at the site of each individual pool, wading pool and 

fountain. The sites are regularly inspected by the Sacramento County Department of 

Environmental Management, Hazardous Materials Unit.

Commission/Committee Action:  None

Rationale for Recommendation:  The chemicals ensure protection of the public from 

biological hazards inherent in public swimming pools and fountains. The chemicals to be 

purchased include calcium hypochlorate, sodium hypochlorate, muriatic acid, calcium 

chloride and calcium chloride. Without use of these chemicals, the Department of Parks 

and Recreation would be forced to drain all City swimming pools and fountains to 

prevent a possible health hazard.

On January 10, 2013, the Department of Parks and Recreation, in accordance with City 

Code Section 3.56, issued Invitation for Bid No. B13191521001 for the purchase of five 

groups of chemicals. Group I is for calcium hypochlorate, Group II is for sodium 

hypochlorate, Group III is for muriatic acid, Group IV is for sodium bicarbonate and 

Group V is for calcium chloride.

Three responses were received, although one bid was not responsive because it did not 

provide bids for all five chemical groups. The lowest responsive and responsible bidder 

was determined to be Lincoln Equipment, Inc., a California corporation.  A summary of 

the bid results is attached to this report.
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Financial Considerations:  A one-year contract for the period July 1, 2013 through 

June 30, 2014, in an amount not to exceed $370,827, will purchase swimming pool 

chemicals for Fiscal Year (FY) 2013-14. If exercised, the option to extend the contract 

for up to two additional years will hold costs at the same rate for three years, from July 

1, 2013 through June 30, 2016, for an amount not to exceed $1,112,481.  

Purchases of these chemicals are subject to sufficient funding in City Council’s annual 

budget appropriation for the applicable fiscal year.

Emerging Small Business Development (ESBD):  Lincoln Equipment, Inc. is not 

certified as an Emerging/Small Business Enterprise (ESBE).
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SUMMARY OF BID RESULTS FOR BID NO. B13191521001
Swimming Pool Chemicals

Bid Category
(includes sales 
tax and 
delivery)

Sierra Chemical Chem Quip
Lincoln 

Equipment 
Company

Price Group I No Bid $256,050.00 $252,900.00
Price Group II $27,440.00 $43,352.00 $39,302.50

Group III No Bid $38,871.00 $37,110.00

Group IV No Bid $8,154.00 $7,500.00
Group V No Bid $4,506.00 $4,177.50

5% ESBE 
Preference

None None None

Prompt 
Payment 
Discount

None None None

1% City Tax 
Preference

None <$3,509.33> None

Electronic 
Funds Discount

None None None

Evaluation 
Total

$39,302.25 $381,639.64 $370,826.63
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